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PHP and MySQL Web Development, Fourth Edition
 The definitive guide to building database-drive Web applications with PHP and MySQL

PHP and MySQL are popular open-source technologies that are ideal for quickly developing database-driven
Web applications. PHP is a powerful scripting language designed to enable developers to create highly
featured Web applications quickly, and MySQL is a fast, reliable database that integrates well with PHP and
is suited for dynamic Internet-based applications.

PHP and MySQL Web Development shows how to use these tools together to produce effective,
interactive Web applications. It clearly describes the basics of the PHP language, explains how to set up and
work with a MySQL database, and then shows how to use PHP to interact with the database and the server.

This practical, hands-on book includes numerous examples that demonstrate common tasks such as
authenticating users, constructing a shopping cart, generating PDF documents and images dynamically,
sending and managing email, facilitating user discussions, connecting to Web services using XML, and
developing Web 2.0 applications with Ajax-based interactivity.

The fourth edition of PHP and MySQL Web Development has been thoroughly updated, revised, and
expanded to cover developments in PHP 5 through version 5.3, such as namespaces and closures, as well as
features introduced in MySQL 5.1.
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From reader reviews:

Joanna Weekley:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or all their friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, likely to beach, or
picnic from the park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something
different to fill your personal free time/ holiday? May be reading a book might be option to fill your free
time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to
consider look for book, may be the e-book untitled PHP and MySQL Web Development (4th Edition) can be
fine book to read. May be it might be best activity to you.

Rosalva Nichols:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book as
compared to can satisfy your short period of time to read it because this all time you only find guide that
need more time to be examine. PHP and MySQL Web Development (4th Edition) can be your answer given
it can be read by an individual who have those short free time problems.

Betty Smith:

This PHP and MySQL Web Development (4th Edition) is brand new way for you who has interest to look
for some information mainly because it relief your hunger details. Getting deeper you in it getting knowledge
more you know or you who still having bit of digest in reading this PHP and MySQL Web Development (4th
Edition) can be the light food for you because the information inside this kind of book is easy to get by
anyone. These books create itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book type.
People who think that in e-book form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this reserve is the answer. So there is
not any in reading a publication especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here
for an individual. So , don't miss that! Just read this e-book kind for your better life along with knowledge.

Curtis Miller:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This book PHP and MySQL Web Development (4th Edition) was
colorful and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book PHP and MySQL Web Development (4th
Edition) has many kinds or type. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan
you can read and think you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book tend to be make you
bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like
reading this.
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