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The years between 1870 and 1900, aptly described by Mark Twain as the 'Gilded Age', witnessed an
unprecedented level of material excess, untrammelled pursuit of profit and imperial expansion. Within this
dynamic and often ruthless environment many colourful characters strode across the world stage, among
them the mining tycoons who were often among the 'shock troops' of European expansion and colonial
exploitation.This volume provides a truly international perspective on the role of mining tycoons both in
shaping the economic and political map of the globe, and in setting a new standard for extravagant displays
of wealth amongst the world's rich. Each chapter is focussed on a biographical account of a particular mining
tycoon that allows for broad and comparative accounts to be made about the individuals, their business
interests, the technologies they employed and the national and internal political considerations under which
they operated.Furthermore, this structure also allows for consideration of the effect that these tycoons had on
the countries and territories in which they worked, particularly the often long-lasting impact on indigenous
populations, the environment, transport links and economic development. By approaching the subject matter
through this stimulating mix of cultural, social, economic, business and colonial history, many intriguing and
thought provoking conclusions are reached that will reward any scholars with an interest late nineteenth and
early twentieth century history.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Mundo:

The book Mining Tycoons in the Age of Empire, 18701945 (Modern Economic and Social History) can give
more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. So just why must we
leave the good thing like a book Mining Tycoons in the Age of Empire, 18701945 (Modern Economic and
Social History)? Wide variety you have a different opinion about e-book. But one aim which book can give
many facts for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or
details that you take for that, you could give for each other; you could share all of these. Book Mining
Tycoons in the Age of Empire, 18701945 (Modern Economic and Social History) has simple shape but you
know: it has great and large function for you. You can seem the enormous world by start and read a guide.
So it is very wonderful.

Jerry Day:

The book Mining Tycoons in the Age of Empire, 18701945 (Modern Economic and Social History) will
bring you to definitely the new experience of reading a new book. The author style to clarify the idea is very
unique. If you try to find new book to study, this book very appropriate to you. The book Mining Tycoons in
the Age of Empire, 18701945 (Modern Economic and Social History) is much recommended to you to see.
You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

Michael Banks:

Mining Tycoons in the Age of Empire, 18701945 (Modern Economic and Social History) can be one of your
beginner books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because this book has good
vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining but
nonetheless delivering the information. The article writer giving his/her effort to put every word into
enjoyment arrangement in writing Mining Tycoons in the Age of Empire, 18701945 (Modern Economic and
Social History) although doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest along with based
confirm resource data that maybe you can be considered one of it. This great information can easily drawn
you into fresh stage of crucial considering.

Molly Wilson:

As a scholar exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library in order to
make summary for some book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's internal or real
their hobby. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to right now there
but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring in addition to
can't see colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important to suit
your needs. As we know that on this period, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says,
ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore , this Mining Tycoons in the Age of Empire, 18701945 (Modern



Economic and Social History) can make you experience more interested to read.
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