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Software for complex problem solving can dazzle people with advanced features and alluring visuals, but
when actually put to use it often disappoints and even frustrates users. This software rarely follows the user's
own work methods, nor does it give people the degree of control and choice that they truly need.

This book presents a groundbreaking approach to interaction design for complex problem solving
applications. The author uses her vast field experience to present a new way of looking at the whole process,
and treats complex problem solving software and web applications as a distinct class with its own set of
usefulness demands and design criteria. This approach highlights integrated interactions rather than discrete
actions, clearly defines what makes problem solving complex, and explores strategies for analyzing,
modeling, and designing for exploratory inquiries.

·In depth case studies ranging from IT troubleshooting to marketing analysis to risk assessments in
healthcare show exactly where and what goes wrong in real world activities and how to improve them.

·Presents a system and framework for analyzing complex work and takes the mystery out of eliciting patterns
of work and their meanings.

·Offers new perspectives for support and new design strategies for building the right models into programs so
that they effectively address users' dynamic work.

·Allows designers to turn findings into useful designs for problems that require users to create new
knowledge but with no one right answer and with many methods of reaching solutions.
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From reader reviews:

Valerie Little:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the e-book entitled Interaction Design for Complex Problem Solving: Developing Useful and
Usable Software (Interactive Technologies). Try to the actual book Interaction Design for Complex Problem
Solving: Developing Useful and Usable Software (Interactive Technologies) as your buddy. It means that it
can being your friend when you truly feel alone and beside those of course make you smarter than
previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you considerably more confidence
because you can know everything by the book. So , let's make new experience as well as knowledge with
this book.

Belinda Kirwin:

This book untitled Interaction Design for Complex Problem Solving: Developing Useful and Usable
Software (Interactive Technologies) to be one of several books this best seller in this year, honestly, that is
because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this particular
book in the book retailer or you can order it through online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It
makes you easier to read this book, since you can read this book in your Cell phone. So there is no reason to
your account to past this e-book from your list.

Heather Killen:

You are able to spend your free time to learn this book this publication. This Interaction Design for Complex
Problem Solving: Developing Useful and Usable Software (Interactive Technologies) is simple bringing you
can read it in the playground, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not have much space to bring the
particular printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can save
the actual book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this
book.

Trent Gibson:

Many people spending their time by playing outside having friends, fun activity together with family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by reading through a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book will surely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It
alright you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Interaction Design
for Complex Problem Solving: Developing Useful and Usable Software (Interactive Technologies) which is
having the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's observe.
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